Lori Kolinchak

From: Danielle Gulledge <danielleg0818@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, September 2, 2024 12:06 PM

To: Lori Kolinchak

Subject: Re: Incident/ fell

Caution: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. When in doubt, please
use the Phish Alert button to report any suspicious emails

Good morning Lori,

| hope you enjoyed your vacation. I’m sorry to bother. The company that did the carpets didn’t put a wet
floor sign down and | didn’t know they were doing the carpet unfortunately. | am ok just in pain. | have an
appointment already with my orthopedic and I’m going to see the physical therapist. Thank you for
checking back with me.

| need to make payment arrangement for my balance minus the down payment. | did inform the Lawyer
at court that | would like that applied to my balance. | wanted to know if 150 every two weeks would be

okay.
On Mon, Sep 2, 2024 at 11:58 AM Lori Kolinchak <lkolinchak@comehometolindy.com> wrote:

Hi Danielle,

| am so sorry to hear about your fall. | am just returning from being out of state on vacation and just saw your
email.

How are you feeling? What did the hospital say?

My out of office message gave contact information to reach out to Tiehira. Did you by any chance contact her?

May | contact you tomorrow to get more details? Please let me know the best number and time to reach you.

| am so sorry this happened, and | hope you are feeling better and that your move went well.



Hello Lori,

| was moving out today and the people who cleaned the entry way had the floors slippery and wet with
no wet floor signs around to warn me. It caused me to fall and hurt myself while | was caring items out.
This is very dangerous and | dread to think if it had been Mrs. Molly from the other unit who would have
fell. I'm going to go to the hospital to get checked out because | hit my head also and my back and
legs hurt extremely bad as | am still recovering from my car accident.

On Mon, Jul 22, 2024 at 12:29 PM Lori Kolinchak <lkolinchak@comehometolindy.com> wrote:

Yes, you did pay 2 months rent at move in. They were applied to your first 2 months. We don’t hold anything but
your security deposit.

Lori Kolinchak - Regional Manager
Lindy Communities - Meadowbrook Apartments

200 Meadowbrook Dr. Huntingdon Valley, PA 19006

P: 215-947-0101 Extension 200

www.comehometolindy.com

OUR MISSION:
Your Exceptional Housing Experience

Please think Green before printing this e-mail.

This email may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient(s), or the employee or agent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
email message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this
email message from your computer. Finally, the recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The
company accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.



Thank you.

Lori Kolinchak - Regional Manager

Lindy Communities - Meadowbrook Apartments
200 Meadowbrook Dr. Huntingdon Valley, PA 19006
P: 215-947-0101 Extension 200

www.comehometolindy.com
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Please tnink Green before printing this e-mail.

This email may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient(s), or the employee or agent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
email message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this email
message from your computer. Finally, the recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The

company accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.

From: Danielle Gulledge <danielleg0818@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 5:06 PM

To: Lori Kolinchak <lkolinchak@comehometolindy.com>
Subject: Incident/ fell

Caution: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. When in doubt, please

use the Phish Alert button to report any suspicious emails
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