4/11/23, 9:22 AM

Philadelphia Alarms

? City of Alarms
S= Philadelphia | s

Your Payment Was Successful!

To print this receipt, please use your browser print button

Date:

Time:

Reference Number:
Amount Paid:

Type of Payment:
Method:

Credit Card Number:
Registration:
Document Number:
Document Type:

An email confirmation has been sent.

Done

Ci

04/11/2023
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$2777.00
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4/11/23, 9:15 AM

City of
Alarms

\;3: Philadelphia

Search Results

Inquiring document: A371080

There are a total of 19 open item(s) on this account.

The amount due for violations is: $2775.00
The amount due for fees is: $0.00

The total amount due is: $2777.00

There is a processing fee of: $2.00

Please select from the following:

@ | would like to pay the total amount due.

O | would like to pay only for the following items:

Please select the items that you wish to pay:

Citation # Date Violation

\/ () 22010109402 06/26/2022 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/[3 22010131592 07/31/2022 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/[:] 22010154272 09/04/2022 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/C] 22010197613 11/14/2022 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/E] 23010051621 03/20/2023 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/Ej 21010114591 07/02/2021 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/ (J 21010129615 07/25/2021 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/ (J 21010140734 08/11/2021 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/L__] 21010155036 09/04/2021 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/[:] 22010041211 03/14/2022 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/[:] 22010094315 06/05/2022 EXCESS FALSE ALARM

/D 22010102376 06/17/2022 EXCESS FALSE ALARM

https://wmgq.etimspayments.com/pbw/inputAction.doh
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EMAIL

Approval Attached

Total payment including fees: $2777.00

Location

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

Amt
Due
$150.00
$150.00
$150.00
$150.00
$75.00
$150.00
$150.00
$150.00
$150.00
$150.00

$150.00

$150.00

ca\&\ FMS

Amt Paid

$
150.00

$
150.00

$
150.00

$
150.00

$
75.00

$
150.00

12



4/11/23, 9:15 AM.

\//[j A22010109192 06/26/2022 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/E] 20010137475 05/02/2020 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/ (J 20010274141 11/01/2020 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/ (J 20010274233 11/01/2020 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/{:] 21010091690 05/30/2021 EXCESS FALSE ALARM
\/[3 21010098163 06/08/2021 EXCESS FALSE ALARM

\/[:] 21010106283 06/20/2021 EXCESS FALSE ALARM

(Submit| [ Cancel

https://wmgq.etimspayments.com/pbw/inputAction.doh

Philadelphia Alarms

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

3900 GATEWAY DR

$150.00

$150.00

$150.00

$150.00

$150.00

$150.00

$150.00

Total payment including fees:

$
150.00

$
150.00

150.00
$
150.00
150.00
$
150.00

$
150.00

$2777.00
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Jane Sharp

From: Tina D Watson

Sent: Thursday, April 6, 2023 2:53 PM

To: Jane Sharp

Subject: 129 False Alarms FW: Dumpster Violations/ False Alarms
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

From: Marva Brown <mbrown@comehometolindy.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 6, 2023 2:36 PM

To: Tina D Watson <tdwatson@comehometolindy.com>
Cc: John Samuel <jsamuel@comehometolindy.com>
Subject: RE: Dumpster Violations/ False Alarms

Tina,

Please pay the false alarm fees. We will still try to dispute them; however, we do not want the penalties to keep racking
up in the interim.

Thanks,

Marva

From: Tina D Watson <tdwatson@comehometolindy.com>

Sent: Monday, April 3, 2023 6:26 PM

To: Dawn Buck <dbuck@comehometolindy.com>; Nancy Benner <nbenner@comehometolindy.com>; Nilsa Reyes
<nreyes@comehometolindy.com>; Doris Scipio <dscipio@comehometolindy.com>; Shana Simon

Cc: Jane Sharp <jsharp@comehometolindy.com>; Alison Snyder <Asnyder@comehometolindy.com>; Lori Kolinchak
<lkolinchak@comehometolindy.com>

Subject: Dumpster Violations/ False Alarms

Importance: High

Hello Everyone,

Can we get an update on the Dumpster Violations? Have you started your dispute?
113
116
190
114
125
170
131

False Alarms 129
Reminder penalties continue, so if you are not disputing reply with your approval.

Please advise as soon as possible.



