11/10/23, 2:47 PM

Review Citation

Payment of citation 016.0004576151 received.

Your payment has been received.

Payment receipt

Citation Number
Date/Time
Name

Card Number
Amount

Amount Due

Receipt Number

httos:/iwww.viewcitation.com/paid confirm
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NOTICE OF VIOLATION
AUTOMATED RED LIGHT ENFORCEMENT PROGRAM
Generated on 11/03/2023

RECEIVED
ARINGTORN TOWNSHID POLICE DERPARTMENT i VED

Citations Processing Center, Abington, PA P
PO BOX 7200 NOV 097023
Beverly, MA 01915

000426

=%  LINDY PROPERTY MANAGEMENT
% 309 YORK RD STE 211
= JENKINTOWN, PA 19046

-

o S

Pursuant to ATC2049, ATC2113, ATC2142 and ATC2177 of the Municipal Code of the Township of
Abington, Pennsylvania, the owner of the motor vehicle is liable for payment of a civil penalty in the
amount of $100.00 if the owner's vehicle enters an intersection monitored by a photographic traffic
signal enforcement system against a red light in violation of Pennsylvania law. Recorded images
are evidence of a violation of a red light enforcement system.

Failure to pay the civil fine or to contest liability within 30 calendar days of the date on this
notice is an admission of liability in the full amount of the civil fine assessed and may result
in an additional late fee penalty and the possible loss of your right to a hearing. In addition,
you may be subject to formal collection procedures including, but not limited to, being
reported to a credit reporting agency, and a civil lawsuit.

Citation #: 016.0004576151 Pin #: 32545252

Date: 10/10/2023 .

Time: 09:12 AM Make.‘CHEVROLET
Red Light Time: 0.50 s Model: TK

Location: SB OldYork/Susqu Plate Number: ZKY4175

Pay online: Visit www.viewcitation.com

Pay by mail: Checks and Money Orders made payable to the Township of Abington. Detach and
remittance slip along with payment.

Pay by phone: 1-855-370-4229, M-Th (8:00 am - 8:00 pm) F (8:00 am - 6:00 pm) EST.

Visa, Discover and MasterCard are accepted.

Payments must be made in full 1o close out the account. Partial payments will be posted to the account however until the debt due

and owing is remedied, any late fees accrued will be the respansibilily of the registered owner. Do not send cash. It will not be ac-
cepted. Only payments in the form of checks, along with this form, will be accepted at the Abington Police Department.

| have inspected the recorded images affixed to this Notice, and believe all the information to be true and correct, and that Approver: Michael Coughlin
the red light camera system was operating correctly at the time the driver entered the intersection after the light turned red.

| hereby affirm & certify that these images evidence a violation of section 3112(a)(3) of Title 75 of the Pennsylvania d
Consolidated Statutes and The Abington Township Municipal Code ATC2049, ATC2113, ATC2142 and ATC2177. As the ’ A
registered owner of the vehicle, you are liable to pay a fine of $100.00 pursuant to PA.C.S.A. section 3117.

Questions? Contact the Citations Processing Center at: 1-855-370-4229, M-Th (8:00 am - 8:00 pm) F (8:00 am - 6:00 pm) EST. Badge #: 4232
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ABINGTON TOWNSHIP POLICE DEPARTMENT Citation Number Plate Number

Citations Processing Center, Abington, PA 016.0004576151 ZKY4175

PO BOX 7200

Beverly, MA 01915 AMOUNT DUE $100.00
DATE DUE 12/02/2023

Make check or money order payable to:
Township of Abington

Mail payments to:
- LINDY PROPERTY MANAGEMENT

309 YORK RD STE 211 Citations Processing Center, Abington, PA
= PO BOX 7200
e JENKINTOWN, PA 19046 Bevery, MA 01915
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Tina D Watson

From: Brian Kroker

Sent: Friday, November 10, 2023 1:41 PM
To: Tina D Watson

Subject: RE: Traffic violation

Yes

Thank you,

Brian

W74 L INDY COMMUNITIES

Aezg Come Home To Lindy + Since 1939

Brian M. Kroker
Chief Operating Officer

Lindy Property Management Company - Corporate Office
309 York Road; Suite 211 / Jenkintown, PA 19046

Phone & Cell: 267-300-6773

Website: www.comehometolindy.com

Please think Green before printing this e-mail.

This email may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient(s), or the
employee or agent responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message

in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this email message from your computer. Finally, the recipient
should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The company accepts no liability for any
damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.

From: Tina D Watson <tdwatson@comehometolindy.com>
Sent: Friday, November 10, 2023 1:40 PM

To: Brian Kroker <bkroker@comehometolindy.com>
Subject: FW: Traffic violation

do you approve for me to pay the violation?

o

AW 4 Lindy Communities

Tina Watson
Accounts Payable Supervisor



