11/22/24, 1:40 PM Philadelphia SWEEP

T City of
S22 Philadelphia

z &(le ‘3 S M
Y Lo OLM > PA ‘\(/Q

Your Payment Was Successful!

To print this receipt, please use your browser print button )

Date: 11/22/2024 (N‘\ M Q r
Time: 1:40 PM

Reference Number: 90222102 .
Method: visa ‘ 35
Credit Card Number: ***+x22805 (\7 {0 {5

Registration: 1698002400

Document Number: 69978370

Document Type: Ticket

Ticket Number Amount

69978355 $175.00

69978370 $175.00

69978366 $175.00

Total payment: $527.00

An email confirmation has been sent.

_NU\J\Cu

https://wmq.etimspayments.com/pbw/transFirstPBWWebServiceSubmitPage.doh



11/22/24, 1:38 PM Philadelphia SWEEP

zl City of
<2 Philadelphia

Search Results

Inquiring document: 69978370

There are a total of 4 open violation(s) on this account.

The amount due for violations is: $640.00

The amount due for fees is: $0.00
The total amount due is:  $642.00
There is a processing fee of: $2.00

Please select from the following:

QO |would like to pay the total amount due.
Total payment including fees: $642.00
@ | would like to pay only for the following items:

Please select the items that you wish to pay:

Citation # Date Violation Amt Due Amt Paid
69978355 10/06/2024 DUMPSTER OVERFLOWING  $175.00 $ 175.00
() 68667340 01/29/2023 NO MAINTND CSTR DUMP $115.00 $ 115.00
69978370 10/06/2024 DUMP AREA NOT CLEAN $175.00 $ 175.00
69978366 10/06/2024 DUMP LID NOT CLOSED $175.00 $ 175.00

Total payment including fees: $527.00

[ Submit ] rCanceIJ

https://wmq.etimspayments.com/pbw/inputAction.doh
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CITY OF PHILADELPHIA
PO BOX 56318

PHILADEPHIA, PA 19130-6318

(215) 567-2605

0 O O O A

MANOR APTS LP LONGWOOD z 10/13/2024
207 LEEDOM ST
JENKINTOWN PA 19046-3235 10CT 2 1 2024

NOTICE OF CODE VIOLATION

Dear MANOR APTS LP LONGWOOD
Below is the official data on a Code Violation Notice (CVN) for a violation of the Philadelphia Code for the individual or

business referenced below at an enterprise registered in your name. As the owner, it is your responsibility to prevent and
correct such infractions.

Failure to pay or contest this violation within 10 days will result in additional penalties and further legal action,
including the filing of a Code Enforcement Complaint in Municipal Court.

FINE VIOLATION | VIOLATION | VIOLATION VIOLATOR NAME
CVN AMOUNT | DATE TIME DAY NAME VIOLATION LOCATION OWNER STREET CODE
69978355 $150.00 | 10/06/24 | 06:45PM Sunday |MANOR APTS LP LONG| 2400 BENSON ST 1698002400
ISSUING OFFICER
VIOLATION CODE/DESCRIPTION BADGE NUMBER TOTAL PAID AMOUNT DUE
DUMPSTER OVERFLOWING 809000 $0.00 $150.00

OFFICER COMMENTS OVERFLOWING

Payment instructions are listed below:
é/ Pay online with a credit card at www.phila.gov and select Pay Code Violation Notices

@ Pay in person at the Violations Branch, 913 Filbert Street in Philadelphia
Monday through Friday, 8:00 AM to 6:00 PM, Saturday, 9:00 AM to 1:00 PM

) Mail your check or money order along with the payment coupon below to the address listed on the
coupon. Write the CVN number on the check or money order.

Returned Checks. If your check is returned unpaid for insufficient or uncollected funds, (1) you authorize The City of Philadelphia or its agent to make a
one-time electronic fund transfer from your account to collect a fee of $20; and (2) The City of Philadelphia or its agent may re-present your check

electronically to your depository institution for payment.

Keep this part for your records (not all violation s may be listed above)

CITY OF PHILADELPHIA Payment Coupon AMOUNT DUE: $150.00
PO BOX 56318 Do not send cash. CVN: 69978355
PHILADELPHIA, PA 19130-6318 G

Owner Street Code:
Request Hearing: D

0 0 A

MANOR APTS LP LONGWOOD If you wish to contest this violation at an

207 LEEDOM ST informal hearing at the Office of Administrative

JENKINTOWN PA 19046-3235 Review, check the hearing box above and mail
to the address listed on this coupon.

DDDDEDEDLDEDHDBDDDDDED'-lEI[]DDEIlSDDDlDLBEHBD



Austin Ansbro

From: Nancy Benner

Sent: Friday, November 1, 2024 1:49 PM
To: Austin Ansbro

Subject: Re: Code Violation Approvals

Yes, Please pay.

Y LINDY COMMUNITIES

)l Come Home To Lindy » Since |
Nancy Benner - Community Director
Lindy Communities - The Northeast Leasing Center
2607 Welsh Road / Philadelphia, PA 19114
P: 215-677-1766
www.comehometolindy.com

From: Austin Ansbro <aansbro@comehometolindy.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2024 3:22 PM

To: Nancy Benner <nbenner@comehometolindy.com>
Subject: Code Violation Approvals

Hello,

I’'ve attached three notices of code violation. Are these approved to pay?

Thankyou

Austin Ansbro — Accounts Payable Intern
Lindy Communities — Corporate Office

309 York Road Suite 211 / Jenkintown, PA 19046
P: 215-886-8030 / F: 215-543-7552
www.comehometolindy.com

OUR MISSION: W7 LinpY Communities 45 Awardsil!

Your Exceptional Housing Experience il 85 _ COMING HOME | 2024 PA Apartment Association Keystone Awards

Please think Green before printing this e-mail

This email may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient(s), or the employee or agent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
email message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this email
message from your computer. Finally,the recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The company
accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.



CITY OF PHILADELPHIA

PO BOX 56318
PHILADEPHIA, PA 19130-6318 ,
(215) 567-2605 l ? S

Nan cY EMAIL

A AR A Approval Atiached

MANOR APTS LP LONGWOOD 10/13/2024
207 LEEDOM ST
JENKINTOWN PA 19046-3235

NOTICE OF CODE VIOLATION 10CT 212024

Dear MANOR APTS LP LONGWOOD

Below is the official data on a Code Violation Notice (CVN) for a violation of the Philadelphia Code for the individual or
business referenced below at an enterprise registered in your name. As the owner, it is your responsibiiity to prevent and
correct such infractions.

Failure to pay or contest this violation within 10 days will result in additional penalties and further legal action,
including the filing of a Code Enforcement Complaint in Municipal Court.

FINE VIOLATION | VIOLATION | VIOLATION VIOLATOR NAME
CVN AMOUNT | DATE TIME DAY NAME VIOLATION LOCATION OWNER STREET CODE
69978370| $150.00 | 10/06/24 | 06:52PM Sunday |MANOR APTS LP LONG| 2400 BENSON ST 1698002400
ISSUING OFFICER
VIOLATION CODE/DESCRIPTION BADGE NUMBER TOTAL PAID AMOUNT DUE
DUMP AREA NOT CLEAN 809000 $0.00 $150.00

OFFICER COMMENTS | A violation of City Code has occurred at this location. Identity information was not recovered from the refuse
material.

Payment instructions are listed below:
é/ Pay online with a credit card at www.phila.gov and select Pay Code Violation Notices

& Pay in person at the Violations Branch, 913 Filbert Street in Philadelphia
Monday through Friday, 8:00 AM to 6:00 PM, Saturday, 9:00 AM to 1:00 PM

=) Mail your check or money order along with the payment coupon below to the address listed on the
coupon. Write the CVN number on the check or monev order.

Returned Checks. If your check is returned unpaid for insufficient or uncollected funds, (1) you authorize The City of Philadelphia or its agent to make a
one-time electronic fund transfer from your account to collect a fee of $20; and (2) The City of Philadelphia or its agent may re-present your check
electronically to your depository institution for payment.

Keep this part for your records (not all violation s may be listed above)

CITY OF PHILADELPHIA Payment Coupon AMOUNT DUE: $150.00
Rl LS Do not send cash. CVN: 69978370
PHILADELPHIA, PA 19130-6318 ST

Owner Street Code:

Request Hearing: :]
DO 0 O A
MANOR APTS LP LONGWOOD If you wish to contest this violation at an
207 LEEDOM ST informal hearing at the Office of Administrative
JENKINTOWN PA 19046-3235 Review, check the hearing box above and mail

to the address listed on this coupon.

DDDDEELDLDEU‘HDBDDDUDEDHDDDDDLSDDDLDIBEHBD



Austin Ansbro

From: Nancy Benner

Sent: Friday, November 1, 2024 1:49 PM
To: Austin Ansbro

Subject: Re: Code Violation Approvals

Yes, Please pay.

"\Y LINDY COMMUNITIES

"l Come Home To Lindy » Sinee 1939
Nancy Benner - Community Director
Lindy Communities - The Northeast Leasing Center
2607 Welsh Road / Philadelphia, PA 19114
P: 215-677-1766
www.comehometolindy.com

From: Austin Ansbro <aansbro@comehometolindy.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2024 3:22 PM

To: Nancy Benner <nbenner@comehometolindy.com>
Subject: Code Violation Approvals

Hello,

I’ve attached three notices of code violation. Are these approved to pay?

Thank you

Austin Ansbro — Accounts Payable Intern
Lindy Communities — Corporate Office

309 York Road Suite 211 / Jenkintown, PA 19046
P: 215-886-8030/ F: 215-543-7552
www.comehometolindy.com

OUR MISSION: YW Linpy Communities 48 Awardall
Your Exceptional Housing Experience i-ﬁ]] 85 COMING HOME | 2024 PA Apartment Association Keystone Awards

Please think Green before printing this e-mail

This email may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient(s), or the employee or agent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
email message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this email
message from your computer. Finally,the recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The company
accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.



CITY OF PHILADELPHIA

PO BOX 56318
PHILADEPHIA, PA 19130-6318
(215) 567-2605

00O

MANOR APTS LP LONGWOOD
207 LEEDOM ST
JENKINTOWN PA 19046-3235

NOTICE OF CODE VIOLATION

Dear MANOR APTS LP LONGWOOD

Below is the official data on a Code Violation Notice (CVN) for a viol
business referenced below at an enterprise registered in your name. As the owner, it is your res

correct such infractions.

\0CT 212024

10/13/2024

ation of the Philadelphia Code for the individual or
ponsibility to prevent and

Failure to pay or contest this violation within 10 days will result in additional penalties and further legal action,
including the filing of a Code Enforcement Complaintin Municipal Court.

FINE VIOLATION | VIOLATION | VIOLATION VIOLATOR NAME
CVN AMOUNT | DATE TIME DAY NAME VIOLATION LOCATION OWNER STREET CODE
69978366 | $150.00 | 10/06/24 | 06:46PM Sunday |MANOR APTS LP LONG| 2400 BENSON ST 1698002400
ISSUING OFFICER
VIOLATION CODE/DESCRIPTION BADGE NUMBER TOTAL PAID AMOUNT DUE
DUMP LID NOT CLOSED 809000 $0.00 $150.00

OFFICER COMMENTS
material.

A violation of City Code has occurred at this location. Identity information was not recovered from the refuse

Payment instructions are listed below:

ep Pay online with a credit card at www phila.gov and select Pay Code Violation Notices

(&) Pay in person at the Violations Branch, 913 Filbert Street in Philadelphia
Monday through Friday, 8:00 AM to 6:00 PM, Saturday, 9:00 AM to 1:00 PM

coupon. Write the CVN number on the check or money order.

Mail your check or money order along with the payment coupon below to the address listed on the

Returned Checks. If your check is returned unpaid for insufficient or uncollected funds, (1) you authorize The City of Philadelphia or its agent to make a
one-time electronic fund transfer from your account to collect a fee of $20; and (2) The City of Philadelphia or its agent may re-present your check

electronically to your depository institution for payment.

Keep this part for your records (not all violation s may be listed above)

Return this coupon with your payment.

CITY OF PHILADELPHIA
PO BOX 56318
PHILADELPHIA, PA 19130-6318

Payment Coupon
Do not send cash.

MANOR APTS LP LONGWOOD

207 LEEDOM ST
JENKINTOWN PA 19046-3235

0000210010L090800000204000001500010132460

AMOUNT DUE: $150.00
CVN: 69978366
Owner Street Code: 1698002400
Request Hearing: :]
Check box

If you wish to contest this violation at an
informal hearing at the Office of Administrative
Review, check the hearing box above and mail

to the address listed on this coupon.



Austin Ansbro

From: Nancy Benner

Sent: Friday, November 1, 2024 1:49 PM
To: Austin Ansbro

Subject: Re: Code Violation Approvals

Yes, Please pay.

'\V LINDY COMMUNITIES

) Come Home To Lindy « Since |
Nancy Benner - Community Director
Lindy Communities - The Northeast Leasing Center
2607 Welsh Road / Philadelphia, PA 19114
P: 215-677-1766
www.comehometolindy.com

From: Austin Ansbro <aansbro@comehometolindy.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2024 3:22 PM

To: Nancy Benner <nbenner@comehometolindy.com>
Subject: Code Violation Approvals

Hello,

I’'ve attached three notices of code violation. Are these approved to pay?

Thank you

Austin Ansbro — Accounts Payable Intern
Lindy Communities — Corporate Office

309 York Road Suite 211 / Jenkintown, PA 19046
P: 215-886-8030/ F: 215-543-7552
www.comehometolindy.com

OUR MISSION: W7 LinDY Communities 45 Awardsit
Your Exceptiona) Housing Experience =l 85 ) COMING HOME | 2024 PA Apartment Association Keystone Awards

Please think Green before printing this e-mail

This email may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient(s), or the employee or agent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
email message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this email
message from your computer. Finatly,the recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The company
accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.



Notice of Delinquency

Total Amount Due: $525.00

. . E,S
fromthe City of Philadelphia | ON ' prrm——
o City of Philadelphia Notioe Date: 11/08/24
0 4le (11 P.O. Box 56318 -
NS 4y Philadelphia, PA19130-6318 L1 .
215) 5672605 o4 11202, , — -
! Howyou can resolve this matter now.
www; phila.gov ﬁ Pay online with a aredit card
at waww philagov and select
OO O R | Py 'Code Voition Notces |
LONGWOOD MANOR APTS LP i Pay in person a the idations
Branch, 913 Filbert Street, Fhiladelphia
207 LEEDOM ST " g
JENKINTOWN PA 19046-3235 Mon-Fii, 8 am-6 pm Sat, 9am-1pm
M Vil your chedk or oney order along
with the payrrent coupon below: Vfite
A a CWN nuTbher(s) on check/nroney order.
Delincuency Notice ©

You have failed to respond to the Code Violation Notice(s) listed below.

Beajvisedmap‘aﬁasrdioemrswawedaﬁapaﬁtyd%I‘uasbeawimxzsedmeednfidatim.
Failure to pay or contest this code viokation(s) within fifteen (15) days will resuit in additional pendities and further legal
action induding the filing of a Code Erforcenent Canplaint in Philadelphia Municipal Court. You arewamed thet, if you
are foud guitty in a munidipal cout, adegTe‘tnaybeateedaga'rstywawdwnaylcsemreydprqaatydcﬂ"e'
rights inpartant to you TreOou‘ccenirrposemtoarradmﬁred%(l)phsmﬂocstspenﬁddim.
Retumed Checks. If your check is retumed unpaid for insuffident or uncdlected funds, (1) you authorize The Gity of
Philadelphiaor'rtsagentton‘d(eaoretin'eeledroricfurdtrasferfrc'nyaracnotrttoodlectafeeof$20, and (2) The
City of Fhiladeiphia or its agernt rray re-present your chedk electronically to your depository institution for payment.

If you would like to contest the CUINS) please subrrit a hearing by mail o PO Box 56318, FPhilackeiphia, PA 19130 ar arline via philagov.

If you've areadly corfested the OUNS) listed below; ywcammmanagafnasadm‘ﬁm has aready been rendered

|

T OMZ lssieDee  Vidlaion - Lowaion " Fine  Penelty Aot D

| 69978355 10/06/24 | DUMPSTER OVERFLOWING 2400 BENSON ST | 1698002400 $150.00 | $25.00 $175.00

I 69978366 10/06/24 DUMP LID NOT CLOSED 2400 BENSON ST i 1698002400 $150.00 | $175.00 $175.00

| 69978370 10/06/24 | DUMP AREA NOT CLEAN 2400 BENSON ST | 1698002400 ! $150.00 | $175.00 $175.00

L. 1 e S .._____!_ i i ! ! i

If you heve dreecyy paid, disregard this nctice | Total Amount Due $525.00 |
If you wish fo cartest this vidation please submit your cefense‘explandion in witing to Glydof
Fhilackeiphia, FOBaox 56318 Fhilackiphia, PA 19130-6318 ar anline & Frilagov. Due to the Covic-

Keep this part for your records: 19 pardkmic, in persan hearings will no langer be corndtcted You will receive a dedision in 60days.

Retun this oot.pcnv\imyo_r paynert_ __ Tt

Payment Coupon Past Due Amount:  §525.00

Do not send cash. CWN Nurroer: 69978355

Retumed chedks will be resubrmitted for
payrrent resuting inan addtional fee.

A0 DO R0 O A + ek your check r rorey e peyabletothe
City of Philadelphia

LONGWOOD MANOR APTS LI . Meilto:

207 LEEDOM ST City of Philadelphia

JENKINTOWN PA 19046-3235 PO Box 56318
Priladelphia, PA19130
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