
2123t26,4:02 PM Philadelphia SWEEP

Sl',Vffifu,P

Yo*r F*ynrent ?das $uc*q:ssfuii

To print this receipt, please use your browser print button
Date: 02123/2426
Time: 4:02 Pl,A

Reference Number: 90263252
l\,4ethod: visa
Credit Card Nurnber: **-2895
Registration: 1265008115
Document Number: 7147793A
Document Type: Ticket
Ticket Number Amount
71077530 $90.00
Total paymenl: $92"00
An il confirmation has been sent.
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1127126, 1:52 PM

swffiffip

$earch Results

lnquiring document: 7 1A77930

There are a total of 1 open violation(s) on this account.

Philadelphia SWEEP

The amount due for violations is:

The amount due for fees is:

The total amount due is:

There is a processing fee of:

$90.00

$0.00

$92.00

$2.00

Please select from the following:

ti6j I would like to pay the total amount due.

Total payment including fees: $92.00

Q I woutd like to pay for this ticket only.

Citation # Date Violation Amt Due

il a8t21t2025 PREM NOT LrfiER FREE $90.00 $

Total payment including fees:

ffi f*leql

Arnt Paid

90.00

$ 92.00

*i'ty *f trhli**:*iphia

https://wmq.etimspavments.com/pbwiinputAction.doh 111
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LINDY TOWNHOUSES LLC

309 YORK RD STE 2,l1

JENKINTOWN PA 19046-3270

Ypu harre failed tr respcnd ts the f;od* Vislatisn MCItine{s} listed helow
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LINDY TOWNHOUSES LLC

309 YORK RD STE 211

JENKINTOWN PA,I9046.3270
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Tdal Amomt Due: $90.00
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Jane Sharp

From:
Sent:
lo:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Melissa Verdon
Tuesday, January 27,2026 10:50 AM
Jane Sharp

RE: 3 litter violation fees for the Townhomes

Follow up
Flagged

Categories: Wait

Yes, ptease pay. We are working to correct this with new trash cans

Melissa Verdon - Community Director, CAM, ARM, and NALP
Gateway Towers, The Enclaves, and Gateway Airport Townhomes
3900 Gateway Drive / Philadelphia, Pa 19145
P: 215-463-5566 ext. 3516
Email : mverdon@comehometolindv.com
Website: www.comehometolindv.com
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Thisemail maycontainlegallyprivilegedand/orconfidential information. lfyouarenottheintendedrecipient(s),ortheemployeeoragent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email
message is strictly prohibited. lf you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this email message from
your computer. Finally, the recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The company accepts no liability
for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.

From: Jane Sharp <jsharp@comehometolindy.com>
Sent: Monday, January 26,2026 5:48 PM

To: Melissa Verdon <mverdon @comehometolindy.com>
Subject: FW: 3 litter violation fees for the Townhomes

HiMetissa,

Just fottowing up on the bel.ow. We usualty do need to pay these or they keep adding more fees to them. Approved
to pay?

Thank you,
-Jane

Jane Sharp - Assistant Accounts Payable Supervisor
Lindy Communities - Corporate Office
309 York Road Suite 21 1 / Jenkintown, PA 19046
Phone:215-886-8030 ext 34 I Fax:215-543-7552
Website: www.comehometoli ndy.com
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Please think Green before printing this e-mail.

This email may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. lf you are not the intended recipient(s), or the employee or agent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email
message is strictly prohibited. lf you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this email message from
yourcomputer. Finally,therecipientshouldcheckthisemail andanyattachmentsforthepresenceofviruses. Thecompanyacceptsnoliability
for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.

From: Jane Sharp

Sent: Monday, January 12,2026 5:42 PM
To: Melissa Verdon <r 'r.i,-i.':.':r'i! --' {indy.com>
Subject: 3 litter violation fees for the Townhomes

Hi Metissa,

We received 3 more $00 City of Phil,adeLphia fees for titter on the premises of the Townhomes. We
usua[ty do need to pay these fines. Are these approved for me to pay?

The City of Phil,adeLphia reatty tikes to issue these fees for litter or overftowing dumpsters. l've seen very
few of these for your properties, some other properties get tons of these! So you are doing a good job for
your properties. p' But do try to keep an eye out for Litter at the townhomes, because it can cause these
[itter fees, and they tend to get issued in ctusters of severatfees aLl. together if someone f rom the city is
patrotting and notices litter.

Thank you,
-Jane

Jane Sharp - Assistant Accounts Payable Supervisor
Lindy Communities - Corporate Office
309 York Road Suite 211 I Jenkintown, PA 19046
Phone: 215-886-8030 ext 34 I Fax: 215-543-7552
Website: www.comehometolindv.com
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Thisemail maycontainlegallyprivilegedand/orconfidential information. lfyouarenottheintendedrecipient(s),ortheemployeeoragent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email
messageisstrictlyprohibited. lfyouhavereceivedthismessageinerror,pleaseimmediatelynotifythesenderanddeletethisemail messagefrom
yourcomputer. Finally,therecipientshouldcheckthisemailandanyattachmentsforthepresenceofviruses. Thecompanyacceptsnoliability
for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.
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