
1127126,1:45 PM Philadelphia SWEEP

swffiffipF

Your Payment lYas $uccessful!

To print this receipt, please use your browser print button
Date: 0112712026
Time: 1:45 PM
Reference Number: 90261938
Method: visa
Credit Card Number: **"2895
Regrstration: 1265008103 08123125
Document Number: 71A77904
Document Type: llcket
Ticket Number Amount
71077904 $90.00
Total payment: $92.00
An email confirmation has been sent.'-]- -- -:
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1127126, '1:41 PM

ffiWffiffiP

Se*rch Rssuits

lnquiring document: 7 1A779O4

There are a total of 1 open violation(s) on this account.

Philadelphia SWEEP

The amount due for violations is:

The amount due for fees is.

The total amount due is

There is a processing fee of:

$e0.00

$0.00

$92.00

$2.00

Please select from the following:

@J I would like to pay the total amount due.

Total payment including fees: $92.00

Q I would like to pay for this ticket only.

Citation # Date Violation Anrt Due

n o8t21t2A25 PREM NOT LITTER FREE $90.00 $

Total payment including fees:

fG,,fitl f qe"Al

Antt Paid

90.00

$ 92.00

fl ifu *f Flriiad*ly:t'ri*
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Tl'xi* is an irx;:rrtalrt urarning; pN*ase r*ad it car*f ully.

HoSc* sf tntemtto File in Municipal Court

71077904 08/21t2025 PREM NOT LITTER FREE 8103 ANGELO PL 1265008103 08t23t25 $50.00 $40.00 $90 00

I*tal Am*tlnt $ue $90.00
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Jane Sharp

Yes, ptease pay. We are working to correct this with new trash cans.

Melissa Verdon - Community Director, CAM, ARM, and NALP
Gateway Tower$, The Enclaves, and Gateway Airport Townhomes
3900 Gateway Drive / Philadelphia, Pa 19145
P: 215463-5566 exl 3516
Email : mverdon@comehometolindy.com
Website: www.cernghometolindy. com

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

0r"IR Mt$st0N:
Yer €xceplional llousrng Expe*l'ance

SUH M*S$ISH:
Your f;xcrpfdoml *husr*g| Fdpotrenco

Melissa Verdon
Tuesday, January 27,2A26 10:50 AM
Jane Sharp

RE: 3 litter violation fees for the Townhomes

Follow up
Flagged

Pleqse think Green before printing this e-mai[.

This email may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. lf you are not the intended recipient{s}, or the employee or agent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email rnessage, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this ernail
message is strictly prohibited. lf you have received this message in erroq please immediatety notifu the sender and delete this email rnessage from
your computer. Finally, the recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The company accepts no liability
for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.

From: Jane Sha rp <jsharp@comehometolindy.com>
Sent: Monday, January 76,2A26 5:48 PM
To: Melissa Verdon <mverdon@comehometolindy.com>
Subject; FW: 3 litter violation fees for the Townhomes

HiMelissa,

Just fottowing up on the betow. We usuatty do need to pay these or they keep adding more fees to them. Approved
to pay?

Thank you,
-Jane

Jane Sharp - Assistant Accounts Payable Supervisor
Lindy Communities - Corporate Office
309 York Road Suite 211 / Jenkintown, PA 19046
Phone: 2'15-886-8030 ext 34 I Fax 215-543-7552
Website: ww\y. cAmehqrnetolindy.Aqm
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This email may contain legally privileged andlor confidential information. lf you are not the intended recipient(s), or the employee or agent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email
message is strictly prohibited. lf you have received this message in error, please imrnediately notify the sender and delete this email message from
yourcomputer. Finally,therecipientshouldcheckthisemail andanyattachmentsforthepresenceofviruses. Thecompanyacceptsnoliability
for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.

From: Jane Sharp
Sent: Monday, January L2,2026 5:42 PM
To: Mel issa Verdon <mvetdo n &qmehornetEl indy.c!m>
Subject: 3 litter violation fees for the Townhomes

Hi Melissa,

We received 3 more $00 City of Phil,adel.phia fees for litter on the premises of the Townhomes. We
usuatty do need to pay these fines. Are these approved for me to pay?

The City of PhiLadel.phia realty tikes to issue these fees for titter or overflowing dumpsters. l've seen very
few of these for your properties, some other properties get tons of these! So you are doing a good job for
your properties. @ But do try to keep an eye out for titter at the townhomes, because it can cause these
litter fees, and they tend to get issued in ctusters of severat fees atl together if someone from the city is
patrol.ting and notices litter.

Thank you,
-Jane

Jane Sharp - Assistant Accounts Payable Supervisor
Lindy Communities - Corporate Office
309 York Road Suite 211 / Jenkintown, PA 19046
Phone: 2'15-886-8030 ext 34 I Fax 215-543-7552
Website: www. comehcmetolindv.corn
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Please think Green before printing this e-mail.

This email may contain legally privileged and/or confidentiai information. lf you are not the intended recipient(s), or the employee or agent
responsible for delivery or copying of this email message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email
message is strictly prohibited. lf you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this email message from
yourcomputer. Finally,therecipientshouldcheckthisemail andanyattachmentsforthepresenceofviruses. Thecornpanyacceptsnoliability
for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by email.
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